CR 2022/58A1 - Addendum - Tabcorp Holdings
Limited - demerger of The Lottery Corporation
Limited

This cover sheet is provided for information only. It does not form part of CR 2022/58A1 -
Addendum - Tabcorp Holdings Limited - demerger of The Lottery Corporation Limited

View the consolidated version for this notice.


https://www.ato.gov.au/law/view/document?DocID=%22CLR%2FCR202258%2FNAT%2FATO%2F00001%22&PiT=20220623000001

*  Australian Government

Class Ruling

: o Australian Taxation Office C R 2 O 2 2/ 5 8

Addendum

Class Ruling

Tabcorp Holdings Limited — demerger of The

Lottery Corporation Limited

This Addendum is a public ruling for the purposes of the Taxation Administration Act 1953.

It amends CR 2022/58 to correct certain amounts.

CR 2022/58 is amended as follows:
1. Paragraph 9
Omit ($3.41)’; substitute ‘($3.42)".

2. Paragraph 15
€) Omit ‘17.79%’; substitute ‘17.76%’.

(b) Omit ‘82.21%’; substitute ‘82.24%’.

3. Paragraph 34
Omit ‘$3.41"; substitute ‘$3.42’.

4. Paragraph 42

(@) Omit '$7,599,079,374.39’; substitute ‘$7,601,518,828.33".
(b) Omit '$2,893,208,433.55’; substitute ‘$2,868,511,262.59’.

5. Paragraph 51
(@) Omit ‘$1.02’; substitute ‘$1.016’.
(b) Omit ‘$4.714’; substitute ‘$4.704’.

This Addendum applies from 22 June 2022.

Commissioner of Taxation
23 June 2022

CR 2022/58A1 — Addendum

Page 1 of 2



Class Ruling

CR 2022/58

ATO references

NO: 1-SCGFHUY
ISSN: 2205-5517
BSL: PGl

ATOlaw topic:  Income tax ~~ Capital gains tax ~~ Rollovers ~~ Demergers - Subdivision 125-C

© AUSTRALIAN TAXATION OFFICE FOR THE COMMONWEALTH OF AUSTRALIA

You are free to copy, adapt, modify, transmit and distribute this material as you wish (but not in any
way that suggests the ATO or the Commonwealth endorses you or any of your services or
products).

CR 2022/58 — Addendum Page 2 of 2



	pdf/048507bc-07f0-4f2c-9c9c-1a9c7eb8488b_A.pdf
	Content
	Class Ruling
	1. Paragraph 9
	2. Paragraph 15
	3. Paragraph 34
	4. Paragraph 42
	5. Paragraph 51



